MORGAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
RIECKER BUILDING

The Board of Morgan County Commissioners met in their office Monday, March 28, 2022.
The meeting was called to order at 8:30am with the pledge of allegiance to the flag.

Tom Bragg, President
Adam Shriver, Vice-President
Richard Welsh, Member

22-134- Motion by Mr. Shriver and seconded by Mr. Welsh to approve the minutes of March 21,
12\/([)1%2 i%ragg yea, Mr. Shriver yea, Mr. Welsh yea Motion Carried

-Mr. Welsh attended a DAC meeting on Monday. He and Mr. Shriver also met with the Health
Department to discuss septic system legislation at Commissioner’s Office.

-On Tuesday Mr. Shriver met with a candidate for governor Nan Whaley.

-Wednesday, Mr. Shriver with Community Ambulance Service operated by Genesis. He also me
with Randy Cochrane and Josh Johnson from Genesis to discuss occupational therapy for
Morgan County. He met with PJ Hinkle to discuss Joint Solid Waste district plan.

Thursday, Mr. Shriver met with EMA Director to discuss EMA grant funds and EMPG rent
being paid out of the grant. He attended Buckeye Hills executive director search committee
meeting in Marietta.

Friday, Mr. Shriver attended a Buckeye Hills General Policy Council meeting. Also, met with

Mary Bogatay to discuss parking issues for Senior Home Delivered Meals.

Cheryl Kintz, PAW.W.S LLC
-Asked the commissioners to sponsor a prize for the Easter Egg Hunt to be held at the common:s.
The commissioners noted they were unable to sponsor something under the “commissioner”, but

may be able to sponsor a prize privately for the event.

Steve Hook, Engineer

22-135- Motion by Mr. Welsh and seconded by Mr. Shriver to allow Engineer Hook to purchase
50 ton of salt at ODOT purchase price.

Mr. Bragg yea, Mr. Shriver yea, Mr. Welsh yea Motion Carried

Heidi Burns, JFS
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-Case Manager and Therapist with Pathways Behavioral Health is starting in our agency on April
4™ this is a free service to our ¢/service clients.

Children Services—tuition assistance program

-Reminder of April 9"—Spring Family Fest

22-136- Motion by Mr. Welsh and seconded by Mr. Shriver to enter executive session at 9:05am
pursuant to ORC 121.22 section (G)(1) Employment, Personnel.

Mr. Shriver yea Mr. Bragg yea Mr. Welsh yea Motion Carried
22-137- Motion by Mr. Welsh and seconded by Mr. Shriver to exit executive session at 9:30am
pursuant to ORC 121.22 section (G)(1) Employment, Personnel.

Mr. Shriver yea Mr. Bragg yea Mr. Welsh yea Motion Carried

Becky Thompson, Dog Warden
-Dog Report-filed

John Wilt, EMA

* Ohio Emergency Operations Center coordination calls Thursdays at 1300 hours

¢ Continue updating Morgan County Resource Guide.

¢ Continuing work on tabletop exercise planning.

e Attended another extensive training for Juvare WebEOC which is a management tool for
daily operations and incidents.

¢ Purging and reorganizing files. Attempting to organize certificates for NIMS, ICS
training, etc.

¢ Investigated EPA report of oil spill in waterway tributary to Meigs Creek. Nothing found.

¢ Followed up with FCC regarding license for EMA radio system- Mr. Bailey contacted
FCC and solved issues, license active until 2032. Also checked repeater antenna and
found it in need of repair at Hawk Site water tower. Checked on Sheriff radio setup at
SR607 and SR60- site needs vegetation controlled and antennas need repair.

e Met with Muskingum County EMA regarding various issues and communications
systems.

¢ Severe weather on Wednesday was interesting. CodeRed issued 7 different warning for
residents in different areas of the county. The tornado warned storm that passed northeast

of McConnelsville had strong rotation, but fortunately did not drop a tornado.
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¢ Performed required monthly test of IPAWS System
¢ EMA Directors conference Thursday, March 31*
¢ Submitted required 60- day notice of hazmat exercise to State. Exercise will be May 19™,

5:00 pm. Tabletop.

-The commissioners discussed a meeting they had with Genesis.

Shannon Wells, Development Office

A meeting was held with Community Ambulance and the Morgan County Economic
Development Office and the County Commissioners on Wednesday, March 23, 2022 to discuss
ambulette needs in Morgan County.

A meeting of the Tax Incentive Review Committee was held on March 21, 2022 to discuss
current tax abatement agreements in the county. The committee members include the county
commissioners, township trustees, county auditor and a representative from Morgan Local
Schools. The companies with active agreements in the county include Finley Fire Equipment,
Miba Sinter and EZ Grout. Shannon Wells will submit reporting to Ohio Department of
Development before March 31, 2022. EZ Grout & Miba Sinter are recommended to the
commissioners to be approved to continue the abatement. The Finley Fire Equipment agreement
is recommended to the commissioners to transfer to Atlantic Emergency Solutions contingent
upon sale.

Buckeye Hills is requesting project profiles to be submitted before March 31, 2022. Project
submissions must focus on workforce development, job training activities, and public
infrastructure. An equipment project will be submitted on behalf of Atlantic Emergency

Solutions.

A response was submitted to the Economic Development Administration (EDA) regarding the
waterline extension project on SR60 for further funding consideration. Environmental
coordination letters and single audit update on status of rectifying deficiencies were some of the
items addressed.

An informational session was held on March 22, 2022 to provide interested applicants an

opportunity to ask questions about the Community Housing Impact & Preservation (CHIP)
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program. Another session will be offered today at 3:00pm. The most recent Habitat for
Humanity build is nearing completion located at 91 S. Main Malta, Ohio. A closing is expected
in a couple of weeks. Another home will be started with CHIP assistance this fall.

A meeting was held on March 24, 2022 at The Stockport Mill for any lodging owner in Morgan
County by the Morgan County Convention & Visitors Bureau (CVB). Shannon Wells attended
the meeting as Secretary of the CVB. The meeting was well attended and lots of good
information was shared.

22-138- Motion by Mr. Shriver and seconded by Mr. Welsh to approve the following the lodging

tax resolution:

(See next pg.)
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RESOLUTION TO AMEND THE MORGAN COUNTY LODGING TAX RESOLUTION
NUMBER 08-474 AS ADOPTED ON OCTOBER 27, 2008 TO UPDATE DEFINITIONS,
ADD ADDITIONAL MEANS OF COLLECTION, ADOPT, MODIFY, AND UPDATE THE

RULES AND REGULATIONS NECESSARY FOR THE ADMINISTRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL RESOLUTION

Resolution Number: (QOQ_IS% Adopted: April 26, 2021

Amended: March 28, 2022

WHEREAS, on October 27, 2008 the Commissioners of Morgan County, Ohio
enacted a Resolution Number 08-474 to levy an excise tax on transactions by which

lodging is furnished by a hotel to transient guests; and
WHEREAS, the original Resolution was amended on April 26, 2021; and

WHEREAS, issues have arisen booking services collecting, reporting, and giving

account of the excise tax levied herein;

NOW THEREFORE, the Commissioners of Morgan County, Ohio resolve to
amend and modify the original resolution as follows:

IN THE MATTER OF AN EXCISE TAX ON LODGING:

Whereas, section 5739.09 Revised Code, authorized this board to levy an excise tax on

transactions by which lodging is furnished by a hotel to transient guests;
Now, let it be resolved, by the Board of County Commissioners, Morgan County, Ohio:
1. As used in this resolution the following definitions shall apply:
a. Hotel - as defined in Ohio Revised Code Sections 5739.091 and 5739.01 (M)
as it now exists or is hereinafter amended by the General Assembly. Pursuant to

Ohio Revised Code Section 5739.091, “hotel” includes any establishment in
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which rooms are used for the accommodation of guests, including
establishments where fewer than five rooms are used for the accommodation of
guests. For purposes of this resolution, “hotel” shall also include a “short-term
rental unit,” as that term is defined in Section 1.c.
b. “Transient guests” - as defined in Ohio Revised Code Section 5739.01 (N) as it
now exists or is hereinafter amended by the General Assembly.
¢. “Short-term rental unit’ means a residential dwelling of any type, including a
single-family residence, apartment, condominium or cooperative unit, in which a
person can obtain sleeping accommodations for less than 30 days.
d. “Short-term rental hosting platform” means a person or entity in whatever form
or format that facilitates, brokers, coordinates or otherwise arranges through
advertising or any other means, a short-term rental unit booking transaction for
accommodations in a short-term rental unit, including, but not limited to,
reservations and/or collection of payment for such accommodations on behalf of
the owner and/or operator of a short-term rental unit.

2. That there is hereby levied an excise tax at the rate of three percent (3%) on
all transactions within this County by which lodging by a hotel is or is to be furnished to
transient guests, as such terms are defined in Sections 5739.01, 5739.09, and
5739.091 of the Ohio Revised Code.

3. That all revenue derived from this tax shall be deposited in an account
established for the Morgan County Convention and Visitors Bureau.

4. That every hotel shall collect the tax herein levied commencing at 12:00am on

July 1, 2008, and shall make a return and payment to the County Auditor on forms
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supplied by the Auditor and approved by this Board no later than the 30th day of the
month following the calendar quarter in which the tax is collected. A ten percent (10%)
penalty shall be assessed on all payments received after the 30th day of the month
following the date the tax is due.

5. With respect to short-term rentals, the excise tax provided by this section
(together with any other sales or excise taxes imposed by the State of Ohio or the
County pursuant to Chapter 5739 of the Revised Code) imposed on any short-term
rental guest shall be paid by the short-term rental guest to either (1) the short-term
rental hosting platform that facilitates booking services for short-term rental
accommodations between a short-term rental host and short-term rental guest(s), or (2)
the short-term rental host that offers accommodations in a short-term rental unit without

the use of a short-term rental hosting platform.

6. That the County Auditor, after deducting three percent (3%) of the sum
received for payment of the real and actual costs of administering said tax, shall
distribute the balance to the Morgan County Convention and Visitors Bureau as
recognized and approved by the Board. Distributions shall be made on or before the
15th day following the date the tax is due.

7. That the County Auditor, after deducting three percent (3%) of the sum
received for payment of the real and actual costs of administering said tax, shall
distribute the balance to the Morgan County Convention and Visitors Bureau as
recognized and approved by the Board. Distributions shall be made on or before the

15th day following the date the tax is due.
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8. Each short-term rental hosting platform shall provide to the Auditor, by the fifth

day of January, April, July, and October, a report in an electronic format of the following

information for each short-term rental unit advertised on its Platform for the previous

quarter:

Auditor's account number;

Parcel Identification Number;

Address of Short-Term Rental Unit

Name of owner and operator of Short-Term Rental Unit; and
Total number of nights rented and amount paid for each stay.

9. That, pursuant to Ohio Revised Code 5739.09, the Board of County

Commissioners shall establish rules and regulations necessary to provide for the

administration of said tax including, but not be limited to, proper notification to all hotels,

penalties for non-reporting of listings on a short-term rental platform, a consistent

reporting format and a procedure to handle late or non-payment.

10. Within thirty (30) days after commencing business, each operator of any

short-term rental unit renting lodging to transient guests shall register said short-term

rental unit with the Morgan County Convention and Visitors Bureau (CVB) and provide

the following information together with a $20 annual fee:

1.
2.

The address of the property

The name of the property owner and full contact information, including
phone and email, of the owner and the operator of the short-term rental
unit.

Name under which the short-term rental unit conducts business, if different
from the name of the property owner.

If the registration is not submitted by the owner of the property, a
certification that the owner of the property has given permission to rent.
Property description, including the number of rooms, and the maximum
occupancy of each room.

A listing of all short-term rental platform(s) upon which the property is
listed on as short-term rental.
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7. Contact information for the manager of the property, to be available 24
hours a day.

8. Certification that the short-term rental unit complies with all relevant
provisions of local and county codes, including fire, health, safety, housing
and zoning as well as the Ohio Building Code.

9. The CVB shall provide all new or modified registration information to the
County Auditor by no later than the 15" day of the month following such
registration or modification.

10.The CVB shall retain the $20 annual fee for administration of the annual
registration or modification.

11. Hosting Platforms and Booking Services.

(@)  Itis unlawful for a person acting as, or on behalf of, a hosting platform or
booking service to provide and collect, or receive a fee for, booking services in
connection with any bed and breakfast home or transient vacation unit located within
the county if such bed and breakfast home or transient vacation unit is not lawfully
registered, permitted, or otherwise allowed as a bed and breakfast home or transient
vacation unit pursuant to this chapter at the time the bed and breakfast home or
transient vacation unit is booked.

(b)  Hosting platforms or booking services shall not collect or receive a fee,
directly or indirectly through an agent or intermediary, for facilitating or providing
services ancillary to a bed and breakfast home or transient vacation unit in the city that
is not lawfully registered, permitted, or otherwise allowed pursuant to this chapter,
including, but not limited to, insurance, concierge services, catering, restaurant
bookings, tours, guide services, entertainment, cleaning, property management, or
maintenance of the residential property or unit.

(c) It is unlawful’ for any hosting platform -or booking service to provide

booking services to owners or operators of bed and breakfast homes or transient
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vacation units located within the county without first registering with the County Auditor.
in order to register, a hosting platform shall provide a hosting platform registration
statement to the County Auditor, in a form prescribed by the County Auditor, pay a
registration fee of $100, and agree in writing:

(1) To obtain written consent from all owners or operators of bed and
breakfast homes or transient vacation units located within the county for the disclosure
of the booking dates and fees charged by owners or operators of bed and breakfast
homes or transient vacation units located within the county; and

(2)  To furnish such information to the city in accordance with paragraph eight
(8) above.

(d) A hosting platform or booking service may cancel its registration under this
section by delivering written notice of cancellation to the County Auditor. The County
Auditor may cancel a hosting platform’s registration for cause, including any violation of
this resolution, by delivering written notice of cancellation to the hosting platform or
booking service no later than 90 days prior to the effective date of cancellation. Nothing
in this section relieves the owner or operator of a bed and breakfast home or transient
vacation unit located within the county from the requirements set forth herein.

(e) Subject to applicable laws, all hosting platforms or booking services
registered pursuant to paragraph (c) shall report to the County Auditor quarterly as set
forth in paragraph eight (8) above, on the date and in the electronic format specified by
the County Auditor, for each bed and breakfast home and transient vacation unit located
within the county for which the hosting platform or booking service provided booking

services in the preceding month. The report must include:
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(1) The names of the persons responsible for each listing;

(2)  The address of each listing;

(3)  The transient accommodations tax identification number of the owner or
operator of the bed and breakfast home or transient vacation unit;

(4)  The length of stay for each listing; and

(5)  The price paid for each stay.

(b) The County Auditor may disclose such information to the appropriate state or
local officials to en(sure compliance with this article, state tax laws, and county tax
ordinances, and any applicable land use laws and ordinances.

(f) Penalties. If the County Auditor determines that a hosting platform or booking
service is violating any provision of this amended resolution, a violator is subject to a
civil fine of not less than $1,000 for each day that the violation continues."

12. This amended resolution shall be considered as an amendment to Resolution

08-474, which, except as amended herein, remains in full force and effect.

Motion by Commissioner
Aﬂlﬂm Shr wer
Second by Commissioner

/Qwhara/ [JC/SA
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Commissioner Bragg — Aye
Commissioner Welsh — Aye
Commissioner Shriver — Aye

Motion passed this 28" day of March, 2022.

*fw/(%[m@?/ ”

Tom Bragg, President 7%
Morgan County Board of Commissioners

Mr. Shriver yea Mr. Bragg yea Mr. Welsh yea Motion Carried
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22-139- Motion by Mr. Shriver and seconded by Mr. Welsh to approve EZ Grout and Miba
Sinter are recommended to the commissioners to be approved to continue the abatement.

Mr. Bragg yea, Mr. Shriver yea, Mr. Welsh yea Motion Carried

22-140- Motion by Mr. Welsh and seconded by Mr. Shriver to approve Finley Fire Equipment
agreement is recommended to the commissioners to transfer and continue to Atlantic Emergency
Solutions contingent upon sale.

Mr. Bragg yea, Mr. Shriver yea, Mr. Welsh yea Motion Carried

Steve Hook, Engineer

22-141- Motion by Mr. Welsh and seconded by Mr. Shriver to table all asphalt bids.

Mr. Bragg yea, Mr. Shriver yea, Mr. Welsh yea Motion Carried

22-142-Motion by Mr. Shriver and seconded by Mr. Welsh to table all liquid bituminous bids.
Mr. Bragg yea, Mr. Shriver yea, Mr. Welsh yea Motion Carried

22-143- Motion by Mr. Welsh and seconded by Mr. Shriver to untable all asphalt bids.

Mr. Bragg yea, Mr. Shriver yea, Mr. Welsh yea Motion Carried

22-144- Motion by Mr. Shriver and seconded by Mr. Welsh to accept all five (5) asphalt bids.
See attachment

Mr. Bragg yea, Mr. Shriver yea, Mr. Welsh yea Motion Carried
22-145- Motion by Mr. Welsh and seconded by Mr. Shriver to untable all liquid bituminous bids.
Mr. Bragg yea, Mr. Shriver yea, Mr. Welsh yea Motion Carried

22-146-- Motion by Mr. Shriver and seconded by Mr. Welsh to accept all liquid bituminous bids.
See attachment

Mr. Bragg yea, Mr. Shriver yea, Mr. Welsh yea Motion Carried

Linda Sheets, Senior Center

-Submitted bills

Jeff Babcock, It Administrator
-No Report

22-147- Motion by Mr. Welsh and seconded by Mr. Shriver to supplementally appropriate
$50,000 to American Rescue Plan (ARPA) 321-0321-5301.00. In addition, transfer $50,000 from
American Rescue Plan (ARPA) 321-0321-5301.00 to EMA 009-0009-4001.00.
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Mr. Bragg yea, Mr. Shriver yea, Mr. Welsh yea Motion Carried

Transfers, Then & Nows, Supplemental Appropriations & Utility Applications

22-148- Motion by Mr. Shriver and seconded by Mr. Welsh to provide supplemental
appropriation in the amount of $505.00 to the line item #001-0301-5303.00 (supplies) which is
the appropriated funds from the SOS for the postage of UOCAVA ballots for the May 3, 2022

Primary Election.

Mr. Bragg yea, Mr. Shriver yea, Mr. Welsh yea Motion Carried

22-149-Motion by Mr. Shriver and seconded by Mr. Welsh to approve payment of bills. *See
attached*

Mr. Bragg yea, Mr. Shriver yea, Mr. Welsh yea Motion Carried

22-150- Motion by Mr. Welsh and seconded by Mr. Shriver to recess and reconvene at 11:00am
Thursday the 31* and met with Spectrum Government Affairs Representative and adjourned the
commissioner’s meeting at 12:30pm.

Mr. Bragg absent, Mr. Shriver yea, Mr. Welsh yea Motion Carried

Tom Bragg, President

Adam Shriver, Vice-President

Richard Welsh, Member Sheila Welch, Clerk

Attachment A:
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2022- Engineer’s Recommendations for Asphaltic Concrete Bid
Attached are the results of the bid comparison for the “Asphaltic Concrete” submitted
and opened during the Morgan County Commissioner’s regular session on Monday
March 28, 2022

1.)_Asphaltic Concrete — Attachment - A

Two companies, (Mar-Zane, Inc. and Shelly Materials Inc.) submitted quotes for
supplying Asphaltic Concrete to Morgan County and its Townships.

Shelly Materials, Inc. submitted a quote from one (1) source; White Cottage Plant at
$72.00/ton, $5.00/ton more than last year.

Mar-Zane, Inc. submitted quotes for the following four plants: Plant #6 located on SR
#60 north of Duncan Falls at § 66.00/ton for 404 materials, $2.50 more than 2021. Plant
#2 located on SR 7 south of Marietta at $ 75.00/ton for 404 materials, $8.50/ton more
than last year. Plant #4 located on SR 33 south of Haydenville at § 65.50/ton for 404
materials, $2.50 more than last year. Plant #13 located off SR #209 east of Byesville at §
65.00/ton for 404 materials, $3.00/ton more than last year.

We are not planning on using any 405 materials due to the high unit costs. However, if
we doj; the cost is $125.00/ton at Plant #6 and $135.00 at Plant #2. This is $10.00/ton
more than last year.

Due to the high cost of fuel and transportation; it is my recommendation that we accept
all five (5) bids from Mar-Zane, Inc. and Shelly Materials, Inc. with the
understanding that the plant location utilized for a given project will be determined by the
lowest total cost (asphalt + transportation) to that project. For example, it may be cheaper
to pay $6.00/ton more for material from the Marietta plant and not pay the high
transportation costs from Philo or White Cottage when working in the Stockport area.
Likewise the Deavertown area would be best served from the Zanesvillg plant.

Stevan Hook — Morgan County Engr.

Commissioners Approvals:

Tom Bragg Date
Adam Shriver Date
Richard Welsh Date
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Attachment - A

2022- Asphaltic Concrete Bid Results
Cost/ton at the plant

We will pick up material from the plant
that will give us the lowest overall costs

Vendor Shelly Mat.
Product Marietta | Haydenville | Byesville | Zanesville || Zanesville
404
2005 S 28501 S 27501 S8 29501$S 2850 S 29.50
2006 S 32.50 No Bid No Bid S 3250 $ 33.50
2007 $ 4100 $ 40.00 | $ 4200 | § 39.50 | $ 45.00
2008 $ 46.00 | $ 45.00 | § 48.00 [$ 4500($ 47.00
2008 $ 5400 {8 5400 | $ 54.00 | $ 54008 60.00
2010 $ 60.00 | $ 60.00 | 60.00|$ 60.00(S$ 60.75
2011 $ 61.00 |8 61.00 | § 61.00|$ 61.00 8 62.00
2012 $ 63.00 |8 63.00 |8 63.00 | § 63.00| % 65.00
2013 $ 64.00 | $ 63.00 | § 64.00 | $ 63.00($ 64.00
2014 $ 65.00 | § 63.00 | § 6500 [ § 63.00 | & 64.00
2015 $ 66.00 | § 64.00 | § 66.00 | $ 64.0011 % 63.00
2016 $ 65.00 | $ 61.00 | § 61.00 | § 61.00 || $ 68.50
2017 $ 63.00 | § 60.00 | § 59.00 | 60.00 | $ 63.00
2018 $ 64.50 | $ 62.00 | $ 60.00 | 62.00 || $ 63.00
2019 $ 86.50 | $ 63.00 | § 62.00 | $ 63.50 | $ 66.00
2020 $ 66.50 | § 63.00 | § 62.00 | $ 6350 $ 66.50
2021 $ 66.50 | § 63.00 | § 62.00 | $ 6350} § 67.00
2022 $ 75.00|$ 6550 | § 65.00/$ 66.00I$ 72.00
$/ton increasel| $ 850 S 250 S 3.000$ 250 S 5.00

1-yr. % Incr. 11.33% 3.82% 4.62% 3.79% 6.94%

17-yr. % Incr. 163.16% 138.18% 120.34% 131.58% 144.07%
405
2005 S 62.00 No Bid No Bid S 62.00 || S 75.00
2006 $ 66.00 No Bid No Bid S 66.00 || $ 80.00
2007 $ 80.00 [ $ 80.00 No Bid $ 80.00 || & 80.00
2008 $ 75.00 No Bid No Bid $ 80008 85.00
2009 $  80.00 No Bid No Bid $ 85.00 | $ 120.00
2010 $  90.00 No Bid Nobid |$ 9500|$ 110.00
2011 $§ 9500 No Bid No bid $§ 10000 % 110.00
2012 $§ 100.00 No bid No bid $ 105.00($ 110.00
2013 $ 105.00 No bid No bid $ 11000 8% 110.00
2014 $ 110.00 No Bid No Bid $ 115.00 No Bid
2015 $ 112.00 No Bid No Bid $ 117.00 No Bid
2016 $ 110.00 No Bid No Bid $ 12000 $ 13500
2017 $ 115.00 No Bid No Bid $ 120.00 No Bid
2018 $ 115.00 No Bid No Bid $ 125.00 No Bid
2019 $ 115.00 No Bid No Bid $ 125.00 No Bid
2020 $ 115.00 No Bid No Bid $ 125.00 No Bid
2021 $ 115.00 No Bid No Bid $ 125.00 No Bid
2022 $ 125.00 No Bid No Bid $ 135.00 No Bid

S/tonincreasel| $  10.00 $  10.00
1-yr. % Incr. 8.70% 8.00%)
17-yr. % Incr. 101.61% 117.74%
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Attachment B:

Engineer’s Recommendations for Liquid Bituminous Materials Bid —
2022

Attached are the results of the bid comparison for the “Liquid Bituminous Materials”
submitted and opened during the Morgan County Commissioner’s regular session on
Monday, March 28, 2022.

I.) Liquid Bituminous Materials — Attachment - A

Asphalt Materials, Inc. of Marietta, Ohio was the only vendor which submitted a timely
bid for supplying liquid asphalt material. The individual product bids are shown on
Attachment “A”, Asphalt Materials’ bid is a “BIG INCREASE” this year. Overall
products went up, some went down. Our primary usage product went up $0.46/gal. or
18.8% more than in 2020.

It is my recommendation that we accept the bid submitted by Asphalt Materials,

Inc.

Stevan Hook - Morgan County Engr.

Commissioners Approvals:

Richard Welsh Date
Adam Shriver Date
Tom Bragg Date
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Attachment - A

2022- Liquid Asphalt Materials Bidding Cost Comparison

Cost/Gallon
2021 2022 2022 2022 2021 2022 2022 2022 2022 2022
ASPHALT WRIGHT PHILIPS Estimated ASPHALT WRIGHT PHILIPS ASPHALT Cost Percentage
MATERIAL ASPHALT OlL Usage MATERIAL ASPHALT OIL MATERIAL Increase Change
MATERIAL PICKUP/GA. Gals. DELIVD/GA.
(New) RS2 $2.25 No Bid No Bid $1.940 No Bid No Bid $2.350 $0.410 17.447
RS 2P $2.15 No Bid No Bid $2.240 No Bid No Bid $2.600 $0.360 13.846
MWS 90 SEALING $2.25 No Bid No Bid $1.940 No Bid No Bid $2.350 $0.410 17.447
AE 90 G SEALING No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.940 No Bid No Bid No Bid
MWS 150 MIXING $2.40 No Bid No Bid $2.090 No Bid No Bid $2.500 $0.410 16.400
MWS 300 MIXING $2.50 No Bid No Bid $2.140 No Bid No Bid $2.600 $0.460 17.692
AE 150 G MIXING $2.40 No Bid No Bid $2.090 No Bid No Bid $2.500 $0.410 16.400
AE 300 G MIXING $2.50 No Bid No Bid $2.140 No Bid No Bid $2.600 $0.460 17.692
MWS 150 SS $2.35 No Bid No Bid $1.990 No Bid No Bid $2.450 $0.460 18.776
PERMICOAT 250 $3.60 No Bid No Bid $3.340 No Bid No Bid $3.700 $0.360 9.730
AE DP SOLVENTLESS PRIMER $1.80 No Bid No Bid $1.690 No Bid No Bid $1.900 $0.210 11.053
PRIMER 20 $3.40 No Bid No Bid $3.190 No Bid No Bid $3.500 $0.310 8.857
No Bid $1.80 $1.89 No Bid No Bid
No Bid 0.36
Total Galionage 40,400 No Bid

| recommend we award the contract to Asphalt Materials, inc.

$ 6,150.00

$ 11,500.00

$ 12400
$ 17,774.00
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